

Code (PAP)	Procurement Project	PMO/End-User	Is this an Early Procurement Activity?	Mode of Procurement	Pre-Proc Conference	Advs/Post of IB	Pre-bid Conf	Eligibility Check	Sub/Open of Bids	Bid Evaluation	Actual Procurement Activity		Notice of Award	Contract Signing	Notice to Proceed	Delivery/ Completion	Inspection & Acceptance	Source of Funds	Contract Cost (P&P)			List of Invited Observers	Pre-bid Conf	Eligibility Check	Date of Receipt of Bids	Date of Bid Evaluation	Post Qual	Delivery/ Completion/ Acceptance (If applicable)	Remarks (Explaining changes from the APP)	
											Date of BAC Resolution	Recommendation Award							Total	MOOE	CO									
20000200005000	2 pcs. Printer, Impact, Dot Matrix, 9 pins	ICTS	No	Agency to Agency (Sec. 53.5)														NINP	20,221.35	20,221.35		18,383.04	18,383.04							
310300100001000	Venue for the conduct of Inter-Planning Committee (PC) Meetings: 1st Draft PDP Chapter	NPPS	No	Lease of Venue (Sec. 53.10)					September 4, 2019	September 4, 2019			September 10, 2019	September 12, 2019	September 12, 2019			PD/SER Allocation	195,000.00	195,000.00		166,500.00	166,500.00							
310100100001000	Venue for the conduct of workshop with the Editorial Team for Drafting the Chapters of the PDP 2017-2020	NPPS	No	Lease of Venue (Sec. 53.10)					Sept. 17, 2019	October 4, 2019			October 14, 2019	October 15, 2019	October 15, 2019			PD/SER Allocation	700,000.00	700,000.00		617,375.00	617,375.00							
	Venue for the 3rd full NEDA Communication and Advocacy Committee meeting	DIS	No	Lease of Venue (Sec. 53.10)					September 13, 2019	September 17, 2019			September 24, 2019	September 24, 2019	September 24, 2019	Sept 25-27, 2019	Sept 25-27, 2019	Staff Allocation	300.00	300.00		252,799.99	252,799.99							
100000100001000	7 pcs. Wireless Projector	ICTS	No	Shopping					Sept 18, 2019	Sept 20, 2019				October 15, 2019				ICTS-MITHI	280,000.00	280,000.00		268,000.00	268,000.00							
20000200005000	Purchase of various Audio Video Supplies	ICTS	No	Shopping		September 17, 2019			Sept 27, 2019 2nd Oct.	10/3/2019 2nd Nov. 18, 2019				October 21, 2019		December 3, 2019	December 3, 2019	NINP	300,000.00	300,000.00		14,112.00	14,112.00							
100000100001000	1 PC Pressure Plate (Original) 2 PC Clutch disc (Original) 3 PC Release Bearing (Original) 4 PC Pilot Bearing (Original) 5 PC Crank Shaft oil seal, Rear (Original) for WTD 561	ODG	No	Shopping					September 13, 2019	September 16, 2019				September 18, 2019		Sept 23, 2019	Sept 23, 2019	Common Pool	18,206.20	18,206.20		16,165.00	16,165.00							
100000100001000	Replacement of parts and calibration of injection pump assy. for Isuzu crosswind SHJ-645	AdS-AMD	No	Small Value Procurement (Sec. 53.9)					Sept. 17, 2019	Sept. 19, 2019				October 9, 2019				Common Pool	25,000.00	25,000.00		23,850.00	23,850.00							
100000100001000	General cleaning of AirCon system of Toyota Innova SLG-439	AdS-AMD	No	Small Value Procurement (Sec. 53.9)					Sept. 17, 2019	Sept. 19, 2019				October 2, 2019		December 12, 2019	December 12, 2019	Common Pool	15,000.00	15,000.00		14,117.00	14,117.00							
	2 pcs. tires 205/70R16 steel belted 2019 for Honda crv ZAS-138	AdS-AMD	No	Shopping															Common Pool	19,000.00	19,000.00		-	-						
	15 blts. Alcohol & 19 other items	FPMS	No	Agency to Agency (Sec. 53.5)															Staff Allocation	9,895.01	9,895.01		9,091.78	9,091.78						
	Publication of the IRR of the National Transport policy	IS	No	Scientific, Scholarly or Artistic Work, Exclusive Technology, and Media Services		N/A			Sept 24, 2019	December 18, 2019			December 20, 2019	December 26, 2019	December 28, 2019				Staff Allocation	400,000.00	400,000.00		195,350.40	195,350.40						
20000200005000	Purchase of Audio-Video Equipment	ICTS	No	Shopping		September 17, 2019			Sept 27, 2019 2nd Oct.	October 3, 2019				October 17, 2019		November 21, 2019	November 21, 2019	NINP	150,000.00		150,000.00	-	-	-						
	30 pack Bookbinding cover A4 & 9 other items	PMD-AS	No	Shopping					October 1, 2019					October 15, 2019		November 8, 2019	November 8, 2019	NBAC-CS	53,100.00	53,100.00		33,500.00	33,500.00							
	20 blts. Alcohol and 54 other items	AdS-HRMD	No	Agency to Agency (Sec. 53.5)															Staff Allocation	103,904.63	103,904.63		94,458.54	94,458.54						
	3 can Air freshener & 7 other items	ODG-RDO	No	Agency to Agency (Sec. 53.5)															Staff Allocation	4,280.18	4,280.18		3,917.19	3,917.19						
	20 blts. Alcohol & 39 other items	FPMS	No	Agency to Agency (Sec. 53.5)															Staff Allocation	25,274.93	25,274.93		23,017.09	23,017.09						
	12 unit mouse & 20 pcs. Flash drive	MES	No	Agency to Agency (Sec. 53.5)															Staff Allocation	5,152.84	5,152.84		4,684.40	4,684.40						
200000100001000	Provision of Food and Accommodation, including Venue for the Conduct of FY 2020 NEDA Internal Planning Conference on October 28-30, 2019	FPMS	No	Lease of Venue (Sec. 53.10)					Sept 24, 2019	sept 25, 2019			September 28, 2019	October 1, 2019	October 1, 2019				Staff Allocation	1,400,000.00	1,400,000.00		1,397,400.00	1,397,400.00						
	36 blts. Alcohol & 23 other items	NPPS	No	Agency to Agency (Sec. 53.5)															Staff Allocation	81,092.26	81,092.26		73,720.24	73,720.24						
100000100001000	Subscription to Existing NEDA Backup Software License	ICTS	No	Small Value Procurement (Sec. 53.9)															ICTS-MITHI	950,000.00	950,000.00		-	-						
20000200005000	Computer Pperipherals	ICTS	No	Shopping					October 2, 2019	Oct 8, 2019 2nd Oct. 11, 2019 3rd Oct. 18, 2019				November 6, 2019				ICTS-MITHI	236,195.00	236,195.00		24,250.00	24,250.00							
	24 blts. Brake Fluid & 11 other items for various NEDA vehicles	AdS-AMD	No	Shopping					October 8, 2019	Oct. 10, 2019, 2nd Nov. 20, 2019				December 10, 2019					Common Pool	42,610.00	42,610.00		41,200.00	41,200.00						
	50 ms Paper Multicopy 80gsm	IS	No	Agency to Agency (Sec. 53.5)															MOOE	9,380.80	9,380.80		8,528.00	8,528.00						
	1 unit push cart trolley	LEDAC	No	Shopping					October 8, 2019										LEDAC fund	4,000.00	4,000.00		-	-						
	Batteries for various vehicles	AdS-AMD	No	Shopping															Common Pool	63,214.80	63,214.80		-	-						
	90 blts. alcohol & 19 other items	FPMS	No	Agency to Agency (Sec. 53.5)															Staff Allocation	53,687.44	53,687.44		49,015.95	49,015.95						
	Various Office supplies	LEDAC	No	Agency to Agency (Sec. 53.5)															LEDAC fund	17,079.90	17,079.90		-	-						
	Venue for the Conduct of the Sectoral Coordination Forum on Oct. 17-18, 2019	RDS	No	Lease of Venue (Sec. 53.10)					Oct 7, 2019 2nd openn	October 10, 2019			October 14, 2019	October 16, 2019	October 16, 2019	October 18, 2019	October 18, 2019		PSSRDC Fund	600,000.00	600,000.00		596,350.00	596,350.00						
100000100001000	High Capacity & Speed Document Image Scanner	ICTS	No	Shopping		October 9, 2019			October 16, 2019	October 18, 2019				November 8, 2019					ICTS-MITHI	330,000.00	330,000.00		268,128.00	268,128.00						
	Venue for the conduct of Presentation Skills Training on Nov. 2019	AdS-HRDD	No	Lease of Venue (Sec. 53.10)					October 10, 2019	October 14, 2019			October 22, 2019	October 22, 2019	October 22, 2019	Nov. 11-14, 2019	Nov. 11-14, 2019		HRD Fund	220,000.00	220,000.00		190,400.00	190,400.00						
100000100001000	2 pcs. tires 215/65R16 steel belted 2019 including mounted for Honda CRV ZAS-138	AdS-AMD	No	Shopping					October 23, 2019	October 24, 2019				November 8, 2019		November 12, 2019	November 12, 2019		Common Pool	19,000.00	19,000.00		13,500.00	13,500.00						
100000100001000	Supply of labor & Materials for the repair & replacement of parts, etc. of 2005 Nissan X Trail (Plate No. SKV-691)	AdS-AMD	No	Small Value Procurement (Sec. 53.9)					October 16, 2019	October 16, 2019									Common Pool	33,036.80	33,036.80		-	-						

NATIONAL ECONOMIC AND DEVELOPMENT AUTHORITY Procurement Monitoring Report for Goods and Infrastructure Projects (GIP) for CY 2019

Code (UACS / PAF)	Procurement Program / Project	PMO / End-User	Is this an Early Procurement Activity?	Mode of Procurement	Actual Procurement Activity											Source of Funds	ABC (PhP)			Contract Cost (PhP)			Date of Receipt of Invitation					Status	
					Pre-Proc Conference	Post/Ads of IB	Pre-bid Conference	Opening of Bids	Bid Evaluation	Post Qual	Date of BAC Resolution Recommending Award	Notice of Award	Contract Signing	Notice to Proceed	Delivery/ Completion		Inspection & Acceptance	Total	MOOE	CO	Total	MOOE	CO	List of Invited Observers	Pre-bid Conf	Open of Bids	Bid Evaluation		Post Qual
	Provision of Internet Connection Service to the National Economic and Development Authority - Central Office	ICTS	Yes	PUBLIC BIDDING	21-Nov-18	22-Nov-18	29-Nov-18	19-Dec-18	19-Dec-18	30-Jan-19							ICTS-MITHI	2,500,000.00						COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	26-Nov-18	26-Nov-18	26-Nov-18	26-Nov-18	FAILED BIDDING/2ND LCB FAILED TO SUBMIT VALID MAYOR'S PERMIT ON POST-QUALIFICATION STAGE
	One (1) Year Maintenance Support for the Existing Unified Threat Management (UTM) Appliance in the NEDA CO Data Center	ICTS	Yes	PUBLIC BIDDING	21-Nov-18	22-Nov-18	29-Nov-18	19-Dec-18	08-Jan-19	15-Jan-19	15-Jan-19	27-Feb-19	01-Mar-19	01-Mar-19			ICTS-MITHI	1,850,000.00			1,830,000.00			COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	26-Nov-18	26-Nov-18	26-Nov-18	26-Nov-18	AWARDED
	Provision of 100 units of SIM Card with Mobile Internet/Data Service for 12 Months	ICTS	Yes	PUBLIC BIDDING	21-Nov-18	22-Nov-18	29-Nov-18	19-Dec-18	21-Dec-18	30-Jan-19							ICTS-MITHI	1,200,000.00						COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	26-Nov-18	26-Nov-18	26-Nov-18	26-Nov-18	FAILED BIDDING/ LONE BIDDER FAILED TO SUBMIT VALID MAYOR'S PERMIT ON POST-QUALIFICATION STAGE
	2nd Public Bidding: Provision of Internet Connection Service to the National Economic and Development Authority - Central Office	ICTS	Yes	PUBLIC BIDDING		01-Feb-19	15-Feb-19	01-Mar-19	07-Mar-19	20-Mar-19							ICTS-MITHI	1,700,000.00			888,988.80			COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	01-Feb-19	01-Feb-19	01-Feb-19	01-Feb-19	AWARDED
	2nd Public Bidding: Provision of 100 units of SIM Card with Mobile Internet/Data Service for 12 Months	ICTS	Yes	PUBLIC BIDDING		01-Feb-19	15-Feb-19	01-Mar-19									ICTS-MITHI	1,200,000.00						COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	01-Feb-19	01-Feb-19	01-Feb-19	01-Feb-19	FAILED BIDDING/ NO BID SUBMISSION
	Negotiated Procurement - Two(2) Failed Bidding: Provision of 100 units of SIM Card with Mobile Internet Data Service for 12 Months	ICTS	Yes	Negotiated Procurement		22-Mar-19	01-Apr-19	15-Apr-19	22-Apr-19								ICTS-MITHI	1,200,000.00						COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	25-Mar-19	25-Mar-19	25-Mar-19	25-Mar-19	FAILED BIDDING/ LONE BIDDER SUBMITTED A CREDIT LINE CERTIFICATION NOT INTENDED FOR NEDA
	2nd Negotiated Procurement - Two(2) Failed Bidding: Provision of 100 units of SIM Card with Mobile Internet Data Service for 12 Months	ICTS	Yes	Negotiated Procurement		22-Apr-19	26-Apr-19	06-May-19	14-May-14								ICTS-MITHI	1,200,000.00						COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	30-Apr-19	30-Apr-19	30-Apr-19	30-Apr-19	FAILED BIDDING/ LONE BIDDER FAILED TO SUBMIT VALID MAYOR'S PERMIT
	One Job Supply of Photocopying Machine Services to the NEDA Central Office Under a Three-Year Service Agreement	AS-GSD	No	PUBLIC BIDDING	22-Apr-19	26-Apr-19	06-May-19	21-May-19	07-Jun-19	19-Jun-19	19-Jun-19	28-Jun-19	09-Jul-19	09-Jul-19			Common Pool	1,600,000.00			1,600,000.00			COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	30-Apr-19	30-Apr-19	30-Apr-19	30-Apr-19	AWARDED
	Purchase of Toners/Consumables for the Existing Printers for the National Economic and Development Authority (NEDA)	ICTS	No	PUBLIC BIDDING	17-Jun-19	20-Jun-19	01-Jul-19	15-Jul-19	29-Jul-19	27-Aug-19	12-Sep-19	13-Sep-19	23-Sep-19	30-Sep-19			ICTS-MITHI	1,795,000.00			1,682,920.00			COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	25-Jun-19	25-Jun-19	25-Jun-19	25-Jun-19	AWARDED Contract Amount: LOT 1 - 861,600.00 LOT 2 - 45,370.00 LOT 3 - 775,950.00
	Provision of Rack Mounted Power Modules for the Existing NEDA-Central Office Centralized UPS System	ICTS	No	PUBLIC BIDDING		08-Jul-19	29-Jul-19	13-Aug-19	28-Aug-19	09-Sep-19	09-Sep-19	27-Sep-19	27-Sep-19	27-Sep-19			ICTS-MITHI	850,000.00			805,000.00			COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	09-Jul-19	09-Jul-19	09-Jul-19	09-Jul-19	AWARDED
	Purchase of Tablet Computers for the National Economic and Development Authority (NEDA)	ICTS	No	PUBLIC BIDDING		08-Jul-19	29-Jul-19	13-Aug-19	28-Aug-19	09-Sep-19	09-Sep-19	27-Sep-19	27-Sep-19	27-Sep-19			ICTS-MITHI	1,379,600.00			1,332,245.00			COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	09-Jul-19	09-Jul-19	09-Jul-19	09-Jul-19	AWARDED
	Provision of Janitorial Services for the National Economic and Development Authority (NEDA) sa Pasig	AS-GSD	No	PUBLIC BIDDING	05-Aug-19	07-Aug-19	15-Aug-19	09-Sep-19	23-09-2019								Common Pool	5,300,400.00						COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	09-Aug-19	09-Aug-19	09-Aug-19	09-Aug-19	FAILED BIDDING-ALL BIDDER DECLARED DISQUALIFIED
	Provision of Security Services for the National Economic and Development Authority (NEDA) sa Pasig and Makati	AS-GSD	No	PUBLIC BIDDING	05-Aug-19	07-Aug-19	15-Aug-19	16-Sep-19	23-Sep-19	07-Oct-19							Common Pool	9,685,731.12						COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	09-Aug-19	09-Aug-19	09-Aug-19	09-Aug-19	FAILED BIDDING -LONE BIDDER DECLARED POST-DISQUALIFIED
	Provision of Wireless Conferencing Microphone System	ICTS	No	PUBLIC BIDDING	9-Sep-19	12-Sep-19	23-Sep-19	07-Oct-19									ICTS-MITHI	1,400,400.00						COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	17-Sep-19	17-Sep-19	17-Sep-19	17-Sep-19	FAILED BIDDING Lone bidder was declared ineligible
	2nd Public Bidding for the Provision of Wireless Conferencing Microphone System	ICTS	No	PUBLIC BIDDING		11-Oct-19	21-Oct-19	14-Nov-19	21-Nov-19	02-Dec-19	02-Dec-19	16-Dec-19					ICTS-MITHI	1,400,400.00			1,388,000.00			COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	15-Oct-19	15-Oct-19	15-Oct-19	15-Oct-19	AWARDED Contract Signing and issuance of NTP (On-going)
	Provision of Network Attached Storage (NAS) and Hard Drive	ICTS	No	PUBLIC BIDDING	9-Sep-19	12-Sep-19	23-Sep-19	07-Oct-19	11-Oct-19	04-Nov-19	04-Nov-19	15-Nov-19	25-Nov-19	02-Dec-19			ICTS-MITHI	1,123,000.00			739,500.00			COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	17-Sep-19	17-Sep-19	17-Sep-19	17-Sep-19	AWARDED Lot 1 awarded ; Lot 2 failed bidding
	2nd Public bidding for the Provision of Hard Drive	ICTS	No	PUBLIC BIDDING		11-Oct-19	21-Oct-19	4-Nov-19									ICTS-MITHI	325,000.00						COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	15-Oct-19	15-Oct-19	15-Oct-19	15-Oct-19	FAILED BIDDING. No Bid Received
	Provision of Hard Drive Through Negotiated Procurement under Two Failed Biddings	ICTS	No	Negotiated Procurement		6-Nov-19	14-Nov-19	26-Nov-19	02-Dec-19	09-Dec-19	09-Dec-19	23-Dec-19					ICTS-MITHI	325,000.00			322,000.00			COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	8-Nov-19	8-Nov-19	8-Nov-19	8-Nov-19	AWARDED Contract Signing and issuance of NTP (On-going)
	Provision of Printing Services for the National Economic and Development Authority 2019	ICTS	No	PUBLIC BIDDING	9-Sep-19	12-Sep-19	23-Sep-19	7-Oct-19	11-Oct-19	04-Nov-19	04-Nov-19	15-Nov-19	28-Nov-19	05-Dec-19			DIS STAFF ALLOCATION/ LEDAC FUNDS	894,375.00			589,328.75			COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	17-Sep-19	17-Sep-19	17-Sep-19	17-Sep-19	AWARDED
	Provision of Software License Subscriptions for the National Economic and Development Authority (NEDA).	ICTS	No	PUBLIC BIDDING	16 Sep 2019	4-Oct-19	21-Oct-19	14-Nov-19	21-Nov-19	02-Dec-19	02-Dec-19	16-Dec-19	18-Dec-19	18-Dec-19			ICTS-MITHI	3,850,000.00			3,808,588.00			COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	15-Oct-19	15-Oct-19	15-Oct-19	15-Oct-19	AWARDED Contract Amount: LOT 1 - 2,898,700.00 LOT 2 - 909,888.00
	Purchase of Brand New Wireless and Laser Printers for National Economic and Development Authority	ICTS	No	PUBLIC BIDDING	04-Nov-19	06-Nov-19	14-Nov-19	26-Nov-19	2-Dec-19	09-Dec-19	09-Dec-19	23-Dec-19					ICTS-MITHI	1,408,799.00			1,184,895.00			COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	08-Nov-19	08-Nov-19	08-Nov-19	08-Nov-19	AWARDED Contract Signing and issuance of NTP (On-going)

	Provision of Eight (8) Months Subscription to Social Media Management Software	DIS	No	PUBLIC BIDDING	04-Nov-19	06-Nov-19	14-Nov-19	26-Nov-19	2-Dec-19	09-Dec-19	09-Dec-19	23-Dec-19				ICTS-MITHI	1,100,000.00		1,070,394.57			COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	08-Nov-19	08-Nov-19	08-Nov-19	08-Nov-19		AWARDED. Contract Signing and issuance of NTP (On-going)																	
	Purchase of Toners/Inks Consumables for the Existing Printers for the National Economic and Development Authority 2020	ICTS	Yes	PUBLIC BIDDING	04-Nov-19	6-Nov-19	14-Nov-19	26-Nov-19	02-Dec-19	9-Dec-19	9-Dec-19					ICTS-MITHI	1,956,000.00		1,725,200.00			COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	8-Nov-19	08-Nov-19	08-Nov-19	08-Nov-19		AWARDED. Issuance of NOA, Contract and NTP upon the approval and effectivity of the GAA 2020																	
	Provision of One (1) Year Subscription of Data Science Software and PDF Editor	ICTS	No	PUBLIC BIDDING	14-Nov-19	14-Nov-19	25-Nov-19	9-Dec-19	13-Dec-19	27-Dec-19	27-Dec-19	27-Dec-19				ICTS-MITHI	1,520,000.00		1,303,232.70			COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	21-Nov-19	21-Nov-19	21-Nov-19	21-Nov-19		AWARDED. Contract Signing and issuance of NTP (On-going) Contract Amount: LOT 1 - 567,997.50 LOT 2 - 735,235.20																	
	Supply of Labor and Materials for the Post Control Services at the NEDA CO from January to December 2020	AS-GSD	Yes	PUBLIC BIDDING	21-Oct-19	6-Nov-19	14-Nov-19	26-Nov-19	02-Dec-19	09-Dec-19	09-Dec-2019					MOOE-Common Pool	500,000.00		393,777.00			COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	08-Nov-19	08-Nov-19	08-Nov-19	08-Nov-19		AWARDED. Issuance of NOA, Contract and NTP upon the approval and effectivity of the GAA 2020																	
	2nd Public Bidding for the Provision of Security Services	AS-GSD	No	PUBLIC BIDDING	21-Oct-2019	28-Oct-2019	4-Nov-2019	18-Nov-2019	26-Nov-2019	9-Dec-2019	9-Dec-2019					Common Pool	9,685,731.12		8,570,564.64			COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	29-Oct-19	29-Oct-19	29-Oct-19	29-Oct-19		AWARDED. Issuance of NOA, Contract and NTP upon the approval and effectivity of the GAA 2020																	
	2nd Public Bidding for the Provision of Janitorial Services for the NEDA-sa-Pasig	AS-GSD	No	PUBLIC BIDDING	21-Oct-2019	28-Oct-2019	4-Nov-2019	18-Nov-2019	26-Nov-2019	9-Dec-2019						Common Pool	5,300,400.00					COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	29-Oct-19	29-Oct-19	29-Oct-19	29-Oct-19		ON-GOING																	
	Procurement of Various ICT Security Subscriptions for the NEDA	ICTS	Yes	PUBLIC BIDDING	14-Nov-2019	18-Nov-2019	25-Nov-2019	9-Dec-2019	13-Dec-2019	19-Dec-2019	27-Dec-2019					ICTS-MITHI	5,050,000.00		5,042,000.00			COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	21-Nov-19	21-Nov-19	21-Nov-19	21-Nov-19		AWARDED. Issuance of NOA, Contract and NTP upon the approval and effectivity of the GAA 2020																	
	Provision of Printing Services for the National Economic and Development Authority 2020	DIS/GOVS/MES	Yes	PUBLIC BIDDING	14-Nov-19	18-Nov-19	25-Nov-19	09-Dec-19	13-Dec-19	27-Dec-19	27-Dec-19					GAA 2020	1,867,900.00		1,327,440.00			COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	21-Nov-19	21-Nov-19	21-Nov-19	21-Nov-19		AWARDED. Issuance of NOA, Contract and NTP upon the approval and effectivity of the GAA 2020																	
	One Job Supply of Potable Purified Drinking Water for the NEDA Central Office under Ordering Agreement	AS	Yes	PUBLIC BIDDING	21-Nov-19	21-Nov-19	29-Nov-19									GAA 2020	600,000.00					COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	26-Nov-19	26-Nov-19	26-Nov-19	26-Nov-19		CANCELLED. Change mode of procurement, from ordering agreement to regular public bidding																	
	One Job Supply of Potable Purified Drinking Water for the NEDA Central Office	AS	Yes	PUBLIC BIDDING		4-Dec-19	N/A	16-Dec-19								GAA 2020	600,000.00					COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	4-Dec-19	4-Dec-19	4-Dec-19	4-Dec-19		FAILED BIDDING. Lone bidder was declared ineligible																	
	Provision of Various Institutional Tokens for the National Economic and Development	DIS/AS/Exec	Yes	PUBLIC BIDDING	21-Nov-19	21-Nov-19	29-Nov-19	13-Dec-19	17-Dec-19	27-Dec-19	27-Dec-19					GAA 2020	1,857,900.00		1,814,220.00			COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	26-Nov-19	26-Nov-19	26-Nov-19	26-Nov-19		AWARDED. Issuance of NOA, Contract and NTP upon the approval and effectivity of the GAA 2020																	
	Provision of Food and Accommodation, Including Venue, for Various Training, Workshops, Meetings, and Capacity Building Activities of the NEDA	NEDA	Yes	PUBLIC BIDDING	21-Nov-19	21-Nov-19	04-Dec-19	16-Dec-19								GAA 2020	7,574,900.00					COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	26-Nov-19	26-Nov-19	26-Nov-19	26-Nov-19		FAILED BIDDING. Lone bidder was declared ineligible																	
	Supply and Delivery of Automotive Parts/Supplies for the Repair and Maintenance of NEDA Central Office Vehicles for CY 2020	AS-AMD	Yes	PUBLIC BIDDING	21-Nov-19	21-Nov-19	29-Nov-19	13-Dec-19								GAA 2020	1,000,000.00					COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	26-Nov-19	26-Nov-19	26-Nov-19	26-Nov-19		FAILED BIDDING. No bid received																	
	Purchase of Six (6) Brand New Motor Vehicle for NEDA CO	AS-AMD	Yes	PUBLIC BIDDING	7-Oct-2019	23-Oct-2019	4-Nov-2019	21-Nov-2019	26-Nov-2019	28-Nov-2019	Failed					GAA 2020	8,200,000.00					COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	25-Oct-19	25-Oct-19	25-Oct-19	25-Oct-19		Failed Bidding. Lone bidder was declared post disqualified																	
	Purchase of Brand New Pick Up for NRO IV-B	AS-AMD	No	PUBLIC BIDDING	21-Oct-2019	8-Nov-2019	14-Nov-2019	29-Nov-2019	4-Dec-19	Failed						Capital Outlay	1,150,000.00					COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	08-Nov-19	08-Nov-19	08-Nov-19	08-Nov-19		Failed, lone bidder was declared ineligible																	
	Purchase of Brand New Pick Up for NRO X	AS-AMD	No	PUBLIC BIDDING	21-Oct-2019	19-Nov-2019	25-Nov-2019	Failed								Capital Outlay	1,150,000.00					COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	21-Nov-19	21-Nov-19	21-Nov-19	21-Nov-19		FAILED BIDDING. No bid received																	
	Provision of One (1) Year Subscription of Various Local and Foreign Newspapers and Magazines for the NEDA Central Office from 01 January to 31 December 2020	AS-AMD	Yes	PUBLIC BIDDING		6-Nov-2019	14-Nov-2019	26-Nov-19	Failed Bidding							Common Pool	599,403.00					COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	08-Nov-19	08-Nov-19	08-Nov-19	08-Nov-19		Failed Bidding. All 2 bidders with incomplete submission of eligibility and technical requirements ABC: Lot 1 - 199,768.00 Lot 2 - 399,635.00 Total - 599,403.00																	
	2nd Public Bidding for the Provision of One (1) Year Subscription of Various Local and Foreign Newspapers and Magazines for the NEDA Central Office from 01 January to 31 December 2020	AS-AMD	Yes	PUBLIC BIDDING		26-Nov-2019	4-Dec-2019	16-Dec-19	17-Dec-19	19-Dec-19	27-Dec-19					Common Pool	599,403.00		590,420.80			COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	04-Dec-19	04-Dec-19	04-Dec-19	04-Dec-19		Awarded to JJJ Newspapers and Magazines. Reso for Award is en-route for signature. Lot 1 - 199,698.80 Lot 2 - 390,722.00 Total - 590,420.8																	
	One (1) Year Subscription of Socioeconomic Database on Domestic and Global Macroeconomic Developments	NPPS	No	PUBLIC BIDDING		22-Oct-2019	4-Nov-2019	18-Nov-19	Failed Bidding							2019 Mithi Fund	1,400,000.00					COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	25-Oct-19	25-Oct-19	25-Oct-19	25-Oct-19		Failed Bidding. One (1) bidder with incomplete submission of eligibility and technical requirements while the other bidder offered alternative amount.																	
	2nd Public Bidding for the One (1) Year Subscription of Socioeconomic Database on Domestic and Global Macroeconomic Developments	NPPS	No	PUBLIC BIDDING		25-Nov-2019	2-Dec-2019	16-Dec-19	17-Dec-19	Failed Bidding						2019 Mithi Fund	1,400,000.00					COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	26-Nov-19	26-Nov-19	26-Nov-19	26-Nov-19		Failed Bidding. One (1) bidder with incomplete submission of technical requirement while the other bidder was disqualified during detailed evaluation.																	
	Provision of Catering Services for the Various NEDA Activities	NEDA	Yes	PUBLIC BIDDING	21-Nov-19	21-Nov-19	29-Nov-2019									GAA 2020	1,580,000.00										CANCELLED. Change mode of procurement, from ordering agreement to regular public bidding																		
	Provision of catering Services for the Loyalty Awarding Ceremony and NEDA 85th Founding Anniversary	NEDA	Yes	PUBLIC BIDDING		2-Dec-2019		16-Dec-19								GAA 2020	880,000.00					COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	4-Dec-19	4-Dec-19	4-Dec-19	4-Dec-19		FAILED BIDDING. No Bid Received																	
	Provision of Catering Services for the Conduct of ASK NEDA Media Briefings	NEDA	Yes	PUBLIC BIDDING		2-Dec-2019		16-Dec-19								GAA 2020	700,000.00					COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	4-Dec-19	4-Dec-19	4-Dec-19	4-Dec-19		FAILED BIDDING. No Bid Received																	
	Purchase of Servers for the NEDA-CO Data Center	ICTS	Yes	PUBLIC BIDDING	14-Nov-2019	18-Nov-2019	25-Nov-2019	13-Dec-19	17-Dec-19	27-Dec-19	27-Dec-19					ICTS-MITHI	5,112,000.00		3,872,950.00			COA,ONE, PISM, PCCI	21-Nov-19	21-Nov-19	21-Nov-19	21-Nov-19		AWARDED. Issuance of NOA, Contract and NTP upon the approval and effectivity of the GAA 2020																	
Total Allotted Budget of Procurement Activities																	75,985,095.12																												
Total Contract Price of Procurement Activities Conducted																			41,881,665.26																										
Total Savings (Total Allotted Budget - Total Contract Price)																			34,103,429.86																										


ON-GOING PROCUREMENT

Procurement of Consulting Services for the Formulation of Tourism Infrastructure Development Plans for Transforming Communities towards Resilient, Inclusive and Sustainable Tourism (TourIST) Program	Infrastructure Staff (IS)	No	Public Bidding	09-Oct-19	14-Oct-19	05-Nov-19	12-Nov-19	03-Dec-19 / 12-Dec-19	10-Dec-19 / 13-Dec-19	18-Dec-19	December 18, 2019	19-Dec-19 / 20-Dec-19	02-Jan-20	09-Jan-20	9 months from NTP	PDRS	84,568,712.00	81,135,374.12	COA-Resident Auditor, Philippine Chamber of Commerce and Industry, and Confederation of Filipino Consulting Organizations, Inc. (COFILCO), Organization of NEDA Employees (ONE)	17-Oct-19	17-Oct-19	17-Oct-19	17-Oct-19	17-Oct-19	
Procurement of Consulting Services for Ex-Post Evaluation of the Agno River Integrated Irrigation Project (ARIIP)	MES	Yes	Public Bidding	07-Nov-19	10-Nov-19	21-Nov-19										M&E	-	-	COA-Resident Auditor, Philippine Chamber of Commerce and Industry, and Confederation of Filipino Consulting Organizations, Inc. (COFILCO), Organization of NEDA Employees (ONE)	13-Nov-19	13-Nov-19	13-Nov-19	13-Nov-19	13-Nov-19	FAILED BIDDING. No bidder was shortlisted
2nd Public Bidding for the Procurement of Consulting Services for Ex-Post Evaluation of the Agno River Integrated Irrigation Project (ARIIP)	MES	Yes	Public Bidding	28-Nov-19	30-Nov-19	13-Dec-19	20-Dec-19	09-Jan-20								M&E	3,000,000.00		COA-Resident Auditor, Philippine Chamber of Commerce and Industry, and Confederation of Filipino Consulting Organizations, Inc. (COFILCO), Organization of NEDA Employees (ONE)	03-Dec-19	03-Dec-19	03-Dec-19	03-Dec-19	03-Dec-19	
Consultancy Services for the Conduct of Capacity Building, Retooling and Coaching Sessions on the International Organization for Standardization (ISO) 9001:2015 Standard and Quality Management System (QMS) at the NEDA Central Office	FPMS	No	Small Value Procurement (Sec. 53.9)	05-Nov-19	09-Nov-19			04-Dec-19	9-Dec-19 / 12-Dec-19		12-Dec-19					Staff Allocation	-	-	COA-Resident Auditor, Philippine Chamber of Commerce and Industry, and Confederation of Filipino Consulting Organizations, Inc. (COFILCO), Organization of NEDA Employees (ONE)	13-Nov-19	13-Nov-19	13-Nov-19	13-Nov-19	13-Nov-19	FAILED BIDDING.
1st Re-Bidding on the Consultancy Services for the Conduct of Capacity Building, Retooling and Coaching Sessions on the International Organization for Standardization (ISO) 9001:2015 Standard and Quality Management System (QMS) at the NEDA Central Office	FPMS	No	Small Value Procurement (Sec. 53.9)	12-Dec-19	13-Dec-19			16-Dec-19	17-Dec-19 / 18-Dec-19		20-Dec-19	20-Dec-19	02-Jan-20	02-Jan-20		M&E	500,000.00	488,888.89	COA-Resident Auditor, Philippine Chamber of Commerce and Industry, and Confederation of Filipino Consulting Organizations, Inc. (COFILCO), Organization of NEDA Employees (ONE)						
Procurement of Consulting Services for Ex-Post Evaluation of the Laguidingan Airport Development Project and the Laguidingan Airport Air Navigation System and Support Facilities Supply Project	MES	Yes	Public Bidding	7-Nov-19	10-Nov-19	21-Nov-19										M&E	-	-	COA-Resident Auditor, Philippine Chamber of Commerce and Industry, and Confederation of Filipino Consulting Organizations, Inc. (COFILCO), Organization of NEDA Employees (ONE)	13-Nov-19	13-Nov-19	13-Nov-19	13-Nov-19	13-Nov-19	FAILED BIDDING.
2nd Public Bidding on the Procurement of Consulting Services for Ex-Post Evaluation of the Laguidingan Airport Development Project and the Laguidingan Airport Air Navigation System and Support Facilities Supply Project	MES	Yes	Public Bidding	28-Nov-19	30-Nov-19	10-Dec-19 / 12-Dec-19										M&E	3,000,000.00		COA-Resident Auditor, Philippine Chamber of Commerce and Industry, and Confederation of Filipino Consulting Organizations, Inc. (COFILCO), Organization of NEDA Employees (ONE)	03-Dec-19	03-Dec-19	03-Dec-19	03-Dec-19	03-Dec-19	FAILED BIDDING.
Procurement of Consulting Services for Ex-Post Evaluation of the Agrarian Reform Communities Project Phase II	MES	Yes	Public Bidding	05-Nov-19 / 07-Nov-19	10-Nov-19	19-Nov-19 / 21-Nov-19	28-Nov-19	12-Dec-19 / 17-Dec-19	16-Dec-19 / 18-Dec-19	18-Dec-19 / 19-Dec-19	20-Dec-19					M&E	3,000,000.00		COA-Resident Auditor, Philippine Chamber of Commerce and Industry, and Confederation of Filipino Consulting Organizations, Inc. (COFILCO), Organization of NEDA Employees (ONE)	13-Nov-19	13-Nov-19	13-Nov-19	13-Nov-19	13-Nov-19	
Procurement of Consulting Services for the Formulation of a Master Plan for Sustainable Infrastructure Development in Olongapo and its Immediate Environs	IS	No	Public Bidding	24-Oct-19	05-Nov-19 / 06-Nov-19	19-Nov-19	26-Nov-19	10-Dec-19 / 16-Dec-19	13-Dec-19 / 17-Dec-19	19-Dec-19	19-Dec-19	20-Dec-19 / 20-Dec-19	02-Jan-20		5 months from receipt of NTP	PDRS	60,336,000.00	59,098,000.00	COA-Resident Auditor, Philippine Chamber of Commerce and Industry, and Confederation of Filipino Consulting Organizations, Inc. (COFILCO), Organization of NEDA Employees (ONE)	7-Nov-2019	7-Nov-2019	7-Nov-2019	7-Nov-2019	7-Nov-2019	
Procurement of Consulting Services for the Integrated Infrastructure and Investment Development Planning for Investment Corridors in Central Luzon	IS	No	Public Bidding	24-Oct-19	06-Nov-19 / 07-Nov-19	19-Nov-19	26-Nov-19	10-Dec-19 / 16-Dec-19	13-Dec-19 / 17-Dec-19	19-Dec-19	19-Dec-19	20-Dec-19 / 20-Dec-19	02-Jan-20		5 months from receipt of NTP	PDRS	59,500,000.00	57,975,863.12	COA-Resident Auditor, Philippine Chamber of Commerce and Industry, and Confederation of Filipino Consulting Organizations, Inc. (COFILCO), Organization of NEDA Employees (ONE)	7-Nov-2019	7-Nov-2019	7-Nov-2019	7-Nov-2019	7-Nov-2019	
Procurement of Consulting Services for the Conduct of National and Regional Survey Research to Estimate a Quality Life Index (QLI) for the Philippines	NPPS	No	Public Bidding	07-Nov-19	08-Nov-19	19-Nov-19	28-Nov-19	12-Dec-19	16-Dec-19 (Tech) 17-Dec-19 (Fn)	20-Dec-19	20-Dec-19	20-Dec-19 / 26-Dec-19	06-Jan-20	09-Jan-20	5 months from receipt of NTP	R&D	35,000,000.00	34,800,000.00	COA-Resident Auditor, Philippine Chamber of Commerce and Industry, and Confederation of Filipino Consulting Organizations, Inc. (COFILCO), Organization of NEDA Employees (ONE)	19-Nov-19	28-Nov-19	12-Dec-19	16-Dec-19 / 17-Dec-19	20-Dec-19	

Total Allotted Budget of Procurement Activities: 385,389,429.72
Total Contract Price of Procurement Activities Conducted: 361,943,935.12
Total Savings (Total Allotted Budget - Total Contract Price): 23,445,494.60

ON-GOING PROCUREMENT ACTIVITIES


Prepared by:


MA. MONICA P. PAGUNIAN
BAC Secretary

Recommended by: Approval by:


JONATHAN L. UY
BAC Chairperson

APPROVED:


JOSE MIGUEL R. DE LA ROSA
Head of the Procuring Entity